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Book Condition: New. Publisher/Verlag: Springer, Berlin | The Papillomaviruses | In recent years there has been
an explosion in research on the papillo maviruses. The viral nature of human warts was first suggested 80 years
ago by CiuBo, who demonstrated transmission using cell-free filtrates. Shope described the first papillomavirus
over 50 years ago as the etiologic agent in infectious papillomatosis in rabbits. Subsequent studies by Rous
established that benign rabbit papillomas induced by this virus could progress to carcinomas when treated
with specific nonviral cofactors. Despite these rich beginnings, the papillomavirus field lay virtually dor mant
until the late 1970s because no one was able to propagate these viruses in culture successfully. In the late 1970s
the molecular cloning of the papillomavirus genomes permitted investigators to partially cir cumvent this
obstacle to their progress. The cloning of the viral genomes permitted the standardization of viral reagents and
provided suBicient material to begin a systematic evaluation of the biology of this group of viruses. | 1
Papillomaviruses: General Description, Taxonomy, and Classification.- I. Introduction.- II. Properties of the
Virions.- A. Particle Structure and Protein Composition.- B. Nucleic Acid.- III. Biological Properties.- A.
Characteristics of the Benign Tumors.- B. Immune Response of the Host.- C. Malignant Conversion-General
Aspects.- IV. Classification and Nomenclature.- V. Description of Virus Types.- A. Human Papillomaviruses.- B.
Bovine Papillomaviruses.- C. Other Papillomaviruses from Animals.- VI. Evolutionary Aspects.- A.
Papillomaviruses and Miopapovaviruses.- B. Evolution of Papillomaviruses.- C. Papillomaviruses from
Epidermodysplasia Verruciformis.- D. Reservoir of Papillomaviruses.- References.- 2 Animal Papillomas:
Historical Perspectives.- I. Canine Oral Papillomatosis.- II. Shope Rabbit Papilloma.- III. Equine Papillomatosis.-
IV. Bovine Papillomatosis.- V. Papillomatosis in Sheep.- VI. Oral Papillomatosis of Rabbits.- VII. Deer
Fibromatosis.- VIII. European Elk Papillomaviruses.- IX. Viral Papillomatosis in Other Animals.- References.- 3
Organization and Expression of Papillomavirus Genomes.- I. Introduction.- II. General...
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